
 

DIGBOI  COLLEGE 
ITAVATA, P.O.: DIGBOI-786171(ASSAM) 

 

Third Cycle NAAC Accreditation 

 

Criteria-3 

Research, Innovations and Extension 
 

 

 
Submitted to 

 

 

THENATIONALASSESSMENTANDA

CCREDITATIONCOUNCIL 

3.1.1 & 3.1.3 E-copies/Documents of Award of Grants 



Consolidated List of Government /  Non-Government /  Industry Sponsored 

Grants Received (Year wise) 

2016-2017 

1. Anuradha Kumari Sahu: Rs. 44000/- 

2. Banjit Kr. Das: Rs. 40000/-  

3. Deborshee Gogoi: Rs. 24000/- 

4. Deepa Sarmah Borthakur: Rs. 9000/- 

5. Janardan Borah: Rs. 46000/- 

6. Jayantadeep Dutta: Rs. 32000/- 

7. Jitu Borah: Rs. 32000/- 

8. Sangeeta Boruah Saikia: Rs. 32000/- 

9. Simanta Bordoloi: Rs. 30,000 

Total: Rs. 2,89,000/- 

2017-2018 

1. Anuradha Kumari Sahu: Rs. 11000/- 

2. Banjit Kr. Das: Rs. 10000/-  

3. Deborshee Gogoi: Rs. 6000/- 

4. Dipesh Mondol: Rs. 30000/- 

5. Janardan Borah: Rs. 11500/- 

6. Jayantadeep Dutta: Rs. 8000/- 

7. Mukunda Madhav Gogoi: Rs. 44000/- 

8. Sangeeta Boruah Saikia: Rs. 8000/- 

9. Simanta Bordoloi: Rs. 7500/- 

10. Nayan Jyoti Khound: Rs. 60000/- 

11. Pabitra Bharali: Rs. 36000/- 

12.  Pradip Dutta: Rs. 40000/- 

13.  Pobon Gogoi: Rs. 40000/- 

14.  Pradip Chandra Das: Rs. 44000/- 

15. Reepa Sarmah: Rs. 56000/- 

16. Rajib Rudra Tariang: Rs. 52000/- 

Total: Rs. 4,64,000/- 

2018-2019 

1. Nayan Jyoti Khound: Rs. 1,16,000/- 

2. Pabitra Bharali: Rs. 9000/- 

3. Pradip Dutta: Rs. 10000/- 

4. Pobon Gogoi: Rs. 10000/- 

5. Reepa Sarmah: Rs. 14000/- 

6. Rajib Rudra Tariang: Rs. 116283/- 

Total: Rs.275283/- 

2019-2020 
1. Mukunda Madhav Gogoi: Rs.11,000/- 

2. Pradip Chandra Das: Rs. 11,000/- 

3. Deborshee Gogoi: Rs. 2,00,000/- 

Total: Rs. 2,22,000/- 

2020-2021 

1. Deborshee Gogoi:  Rs. 4,00,000/- 

Total: Rs. 4,00,000/- 
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Bhaskar Jyoti Bora <bhaskarbora@ncf-india.org> 

Date: Wed, Oct 13, 2021 at 2:11 PM 
Subject: Re: The draft MoU and ToR again 
To: RAJIB RUDRA TARIANG <rajibrudratariang@gmail.com> 
Cc: Aparajita Datta <aparajita@ncf-india.org> 
 
 

Dear  Rajib da, 
 
I am attaching a template for the certificate requested by you. 
Please go through this and incorporate anything if needed/missing for 
your reference. 
Once finalised from your side, we will use our letterhead and send you the signed 
.pdf copy. 
 
FYI, 
@RAJIB RUDRA TARIANG   

1. The MoU was effective from 1st August 2018 to November 2019. 
2. The amount spent by you during the tenure of the MoU for conservation 

activities was 1,16,283/- rupees. 

3. Money returned by you was 56,217/- rupees, which was not spent. 

 
Best Regards, 
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